
Reigate Grammar Week 3

Sausage braised in white
wine and caramelised
onion £2.85

Slow roasted garlic and
lemon chicken £2.85

Roasted red peppers
stuffed with fennel and
mushroom £2.55

Pasta Carbonara £2.55

Veggie Carbonara £2.55

New potatoes and
steamed broccoli

Fruit Crumble and vanilla
sauce £1.00

Lamb curry served with
pilaf rice and mini naan
bread £2.85

Pot roasted chicken drum
stick's with root
vegetables and bacon
£2.85

Vegetable curry served
with pilaf rice mini naan
bread £2.55

Classic beef Lasagne £2.55

Mushroom and spinach
Lasagne £2.55

Chunky Sauté potatoes
and sweetcorn

Apple & pear strudel and
custard £1.00

Your choice of roast beef,
gammon, turkey, pork &
homemade gravy

Saffron scented chicken
pilaf £2.85

Tomato tart with French
cheese and rosemary
£2.55

Butternut squash and tuna
pasta £2.55

Cheesy broccoli pasta
bake £2.55

Roast potatoes and
roasted root vegetables

White chocolate pudding
and plum sauce £1.00

Slow braised pork with
bacon apple cider £2.85

Rich winter vegetable pie
made with homemade
shortcrust pastry £2.85

Vegetable pie made with
homemade shortcrust
pastry £2.55

Pasta served with chicken
pesto sauce (nut free)
£2.55

Pasta with a tomato ragu
£2.55

Creamy mash potato and
green beans

Rhubarb and ginger
steamed pudding and
custard £1.00

Deep fried fish of the day
served with homemade
tartar sauce £2.85

Potato pea fishcake served
with green salad & spring
onion mayo £2.85

Spinach red onion and
cheese en croute £2.55

Pasta of the day £2.55

Pasta with feta five bean
and tomato sauce £2.55

Chips, peas and beans

Jam rolly polly & custard
£1.00

Daily Cakes Monday Ginger Bread Tuesday Lemon Drizzle cake Wednesday Marble Cake Thursday Caribbean
Cake Friday Chocolate Muffins


